

  
    
            
        
      
      
        
          
        

        
          
            
          
        
        
          
            
              
                
              
            

            
              
                
                  Recently Searched
                

              

                
                  
                      
                      
                        
                      
                  

                
              
                No results found
              

            

          

          
            
              

                
              
            

            
              
                Tags
              

              
                
                  
                      
                  
                
              

              
                

              

              
                No results found
              

            

          

          
            
              
                
              
            

            
              
                Document
              

              
                
                  
                      
                  
                
              

              
                

              

              
                No results found
              

            

          

        

      

    

    
      
        
          
        
      
              

                        
  
  

                
            
            
        
        English
                        
          
            
            
              
                Home
                
                  
                
              
              
                Schools
                
                  
                
              
              
                Topics
                
                  
                
              
            

          

        


        
          Log in
        
        
        
        
        
          

  





  
    
      
      	
            
              
              
            
            Delete
          
	
            
              
              
            
          
	
            
              
                
              
              
            
          
	
          

        
	No results found


      
        
          
        
      
    

  







  
      
  
    
    	
                                    
              Home
            
            




	
                          
                
              
                        
              Other
            
            


      
                  THE FINANCE BILL, 2016
      

      
        
          
            
              
                
              
            
            
            
              
                Share "THE FINANCE BILL, 2016"

                
                  
                    
                  
                  
                    
                  
                  
                    
                  
                  
                    
                  
                

                
                  

                  
                    COPY
                  
                

              

            

          

          
            
              

                
              
            
          

        

      

    

    
      
        
          
            
              
            
                          
                N/A
              
                      


          
            
              
            
                          
                N/A
              
                      

        

        
                      
              
                
              
                               Protected
                          

                    
            
              
            
            
              Academic year: 
                2022
              
            

          

        

        
          
            
            
                
                    
                
                Info
                
                

            
            

            

                        
  

                
        Download
          
              

          
            
              
                
                Protected

              

              
                
                
                  Academic year: 2022
                

              

            

            
              
                
                  
                
                
                
                  
                    Share "THE FINANCE BILL, 2016"

                    
                      
                        
                      
                      
                        
                      
                      
                        
                      
                      
                        
                      
                    

                    
                      

                      
                        
                      
                    

                    Copied!

                  

                

              

              
                
                  
                
              

            

            
              
                
                208
              

              
                
                0
              

              
                
                0
              

            

          

        

      

      
        
                              
            
            208
          

          
            
            0
          

          
            
            0
          

        

      

    

  



  
        
                    
  
    
    
      
        Loading....
        (view fulltext now)
      

      
        
      

      
      

    

  




  
      

                    Show more (   Page )
        
  


  
      

                    Download now ( 208 Page )
      



      
            
  
    Full text

    
      (1)
THE FINANCE BILL, 2016


_________


ARRANGEMENT    OF   CLAUSES
 __________


CHAPTER  I
 PRELIMINARY


CLAUSES


1. Short title and commencement.


CHAPTER  II
 RATESOF INCOME-TAX


2. Income-tax.


CHAPTER  III
 DIRECT TAXES


Income-tax
 3. Amendment of section 2.


4. Amendment of section 6.


5. Amendment of section 9.


6. Amendment of section 9A.


7. Amendment of section 10.


8. Amendment of section 10AA.


9. Amendment of section 17.


10. Amendment of section 24.


11. Substitution of new section for sections 25A, 25AA and 25B.


12. Amendment of section 28.


13. Amendment of section 32.


14. Amendment of section 32AC.


15. Amendment of section 35.


16. Insertion of new section 35ABA.


17. Amendment of section 35AC.


18. Amendment of section 35AD.


19. Amendment of section 35CCC.


20. Amendment of section 35CCD.


21. Amendment of section 36.


22. Amendment of section 40.


23. Amendment of section 43B.


24. Amendment of section 44AA.


25. Amendment of section 44AB.


Bill No. 18-C of  2016



(2)26. Amendment of section 44AD.


27. Insertion of new section 44ADA.


28. Amendment of section 47.


29. Amendment of section 48.


30. Amendment of section 49.


31. Amendment of section 50C.


32. Insertion of new section 54EE.


33. Amendment of section 54GB.


34. Amendment of section 55.


35. Amendment of section 56.


36. Amendment of section 80.


37. Amendment of section 80CCD.


38. Substitution of new section for section 80EE.


39. Amendment of section 80GG.


40. Amendment of section 80-IA.


41. Amendment of section 80-IAB.


42. Insertion of new section 80-IAC.


43. Amendment of section 80-IB.


44. Insertion of new section 80-IBA.


45. Substitution of new section for section 80JJAA.


46. Amendment of section 87A.


47. Amendment of section 92CA.


48. Amendment of section 92D.


49. Amendment of section 111A.


50. Amendment of section 112.


51. Insertion of new section 115BA.


52. Insertion of new section 115BBDA.


53. Amendment of section 115BBE.


54. Insertion of new section 115BBF.


55. Amendment of section 115JB.


56. Insertion of new Chapter XII-BC.


57. Amendment of section 115-O.


58. Amendment of section 115QA.


59. Amendment of section 115TA.


60. Amendment of section 115TC.


61. Insertion of new section 115TCA.


62. Insertion of new Chapter XII-EB.


63. Amendment of section 115UA.


64. Amendment of section 119.


65. Amendment of section 124.


66. Amendment of section 133C.


67. Amendment of section 139.


68. Amendment of section 143.


69. Amendment of section 147.


70. Substitution of new section for section 153.


71. Substitution of new section for section 153B.


72. Amendment of section 192A.


73. Amendment of section 194BB.


74. Amendment of section 194C.


75. Amendment of section 194D.


76. Amendment of section 194DA.


77. Amendment of section 194EE.


78. Amendment of section 194G.


CLAUSES



(3)79. Amendment of section 194H.


80. Omission of sections 194K and 194L.


81. Amendment of section 194LA.


82. Amendment of section 194LBA.


83. Amendment of section 194LBB.


84. Insertion of new section 194LBC.


85. Amendment of section 197.


86. Amendment of section 197A.


87. Amendment of section 206AA.


88. Amendment of section 206C.


89. Amendment of section 211.


90. Amendment of section 220.


91. Amendment of section 234C.


92. Amendment of section 244A.


93. Amendment of section 249.


94. Amendment of section 252.


95. Amendment of section 253.


96. Amendment of section 254.


97. Amendment of section 255.


98. Insertion of new section 270A.


99. Insertion of new section 270AA.


100. Amendment of section 271.


101. Amendment of section 271A.


102. Amendment of section 271AA.


103. Amendment of section 271AAB.


104. Insertion of new section 271GB.


105. Amendment of section 272A.


106. Amendment of section 273A.


107. Amendment of section 273AA.


108. Amendment of section 273B.


109. Amendment of section 276C.


110. Amendment of section 279.


111. Amendment of section 281B.


112. Amendment of section 282A.


113. Insertion of new section 286.


114. Amendment of section 288.


115. Amendment of Fourth Schedule.


CHAPTER IV
 INDIRECT TAXES


Customs
 116. Amendment of section 2.


117. Amendment of chapter heading of Chapter III.


118. Omission of section 9.


119. Amendment of section 25.


120. Amendment of section 28.


121. Amendment of section 47.


122. Amendment of section 51.


123. Substitution of new section for section 53.


124. Substitution of new section for section 57.


125. Substitution of new sections 58, 58A and 58B for section 58.


CLAUSES



(4)126. Substitution of new section for section 59.


127. Substitution of new section for section 60.


128. Substitution of new section for section 61.


129. Omission of sections 62 and 63.


130. Substitution of new section for section 64.


131. Amendment of section 65.


132. Amendment of section 68.


133. Amendment of section 69.


134. Amendment of section 71.


135. Amendment of section 72.


136. Amendment of section 73.


137. Insertion of new section 73A.


138. Amendment of section 156.


139. Amendment of notifications issued under section 25 of Act 52 of 1962.


Customs Tariff
 140. Omission of section 8C.


141. Amendment of First Schedule.


Excise
 142. Amendment of section 5A.


143. Amendment of section 11A.


144. Amendment of section 37B.


145. Amendment of Third Schedule.


Excise Tariff
 146. Amendment of First Schedule.


147. Amendment of Second Schedule.


CHAPTER V
 SERVICE TAX


148. Amendment of section 65B.


149. Amendment of section 66D.


150. Amendment of section 66E.


151. Amendment of section 67A.


152. Amendment of section 73.


153. Amendment of section 75.


154. Amendment of section 78A.


155. Amendment of section 89.


156. Amendment of section 90.


157. Amendment of section 91.


158. Amendment of section 93A.


158. Insertion of new sections 101, 102 and 103.


160. Amendment of notification issued under section 93A of Finance Act, 1994.


CHAPTER VI
 KRISHI KALYAN CESS


161. Krishi Kalyan Cess.


CLAUSES



(5)CHAPTER VII
 INFRASTRUCTURE CESS


162. Infrastructure Cess.


CHAPTER VIII
 EQUALISATION  LEVY


163. Extent, commencement and application.


164. Definitions.


165. Charge of equalisation levy.


166. Collection and recovery of equalisation levy.


167. Furnishing of statement.


168. Processing of statement.


169. Rectification of mistake.


170. Interest on delayed payment of equalisation levy.


171. Penalty for failure to deduct or pay equalisation levy.


172. Penalty for failure to furnish statement.


173. Penalty not to be imposed in certain cases.


174. Appeal to Commissioner of Income-tax (Appeals).


175. Appeal to Appellate Tribunal.


176. Punishment for false statement.


177. Institution of prosecution.


178. Application of certains provisions of Income-tax Act.


179. Power to make rules.


180. Power to remove difficulties.


CHAPTER IX


THE INCOME DECLARATION SCHEME, 2016
 181. Short title and commencement.


182. Definitions.


183. Declaration of undisclosed income.


184. Charge of tax and surcharge.


185. Penalty.


186. Manner of declaration.


187. Time for payment of tax.


188. Undisclosed income declared not to be included in total income.


189. Undisclosed income declared not to affect for finality of completed assessments.


190. Undisclosed income declared not to be treated as benami transaction in certain
 cases.


191. Tax in respect of voluntarily disclosed income not refundable.


192. Declaration not admissible in evidence against declarant.


193. Declaration by misrepresentation of facts to be void.


194. Exemption from wealth-tax in respect of assets specified in declaration.


195. Applicability of certain provisions of Income-tax Act and of Chapter V of Wealth-
 tax Act.


196. Scheme not to apply to certain persons.


197. Removal of doubts.


198. Power to remove difficulties.


199. Power to make rules.


CLAUSES



(6)CHAPTER X


THE DIRECT TAX DISPUTE RESOLUTION SCHEME, 2016
 200. Short title and commencement.


201. Definitions.


202. Declaration of tax payble.


203. Particulars to be furnished.


204. Time and manner of payment.


205. Immunity from initiation of proceedings in respect of offence and imposition of
 penalty in certain cases.


206. No refund of amount paid under Scheme.


207. No other benefit, concession or immunity to declarant.


208. Scheme not to apply in certain cases.


209. Power of Central Government to issue directions, etc.


210. Power to remove difficulties.


211. Power to make rules.


CHAPTER XI


THE INDIRECT TAX DISPUTE RESOLUTION SCHEME, 2016
 212. Short title, application and commencement.


213. Definitions.


214. Procedure for making declaration.


215. Scheme not to apply in certain cases.


216. Immunity from other proceedings under Act.


217. Consequences of order made under Scheme.


218. Power to make rules.


CHAPTER XII
 MISCELLANEOUS


PART  I


AMENDMENTSTO THE RESERVE BANKOF INDIA ACT, 1934
 219. Commencement and Amendment of Act 2 of 1934.


220. Amendment of Preamble.


221. Amendment of section 2.


222. Insertion of new Chapter III F.


223. Amendment of section 58.


PART II


AMENDMENTTO THE CENTRAL SALES TAX ACT, 1956
 224. Amendment of Act 74 of 1956.


PART III


AMENDMENTTO THE OIL INDUSTRY (DEVELOPMENT) ACT, 1974
 225. Amendment of Schedule to Act 47 of 1974.


CLAUSES



(7)PART IV


AMENDMENTTO THE SUMGGLERSAND FOREIGN EXCHANGE MANIPULATORS


(FOREFEITUREOF PROPERTY) ACT, 1976
 226. Amendment of Act 13 of  1976.


PART V


AMENDMENTTOTHE NARCOTIC DRUGSAND PSYCHOTROPIC SUBSTANCES ACT, 1985
 227. Amendment of Act 61 of  1985.


PART VI


AMENDMENTTOTHE FOREIGN EXCHANGE MANAGEMENT ACT, 1999
 228. Commencement of this Part.


229. Amendment of Act 42 of  1999.


PART VII


AMENDMENTTOTHE CENTRAL ROAD FUND ACT, 2000
 230. Amendment of Act 54 of  2000.


PART VIII


AMENDMENTTOTHE FINANCE ACT, 2001
 231. Amendment of Act 14 of  2001.


PART IX


AMENDMENTTOTHE PREVENTIONOF MONEY-LAUNDERING ACT, 2002
 232. Amendment of Act 15 of  2003.


PART X


AMENDMENTTOTHE FINANCE (NO.2) ACT, 2004
 233. Amendment of Act 23 of  2004.


PART XI


AMENDMENTTOTHE FINANCE ACT, 2005
 234. Amendment of Act 18 of  2005.


PART XII


AMENDMENTTOTHE FINANCE ACT, 2010
 235. Amendment of Act 14 of  2010.


PART XIII


AMENDMENTTOTHE FOREIGN CONTRIBUTION (REGULATION) ACT, 2010
 236. Amendment of section 2 of Act 42 of  2010.


PART XIV


AMENDMENTTOTHE FINANCE ACT, 2013
 237. Amendment of Act 17 of  2013.


CLAUSES



(8)PART XV


AMENDMENTTOTHE FINANCE ACT, 2015
 238. Amendment of Act 20 of  2015.


PART XVI


REPEALAND AMENDMENTOF CERTAIN ENACTMENTS


239. Repeal and amendment of certain enactments.


240. Savings.


241. Collection and payment of arrears of duties.


THE FIRST SCHEDULE.


THE SECOND SCHEDULE.


THE THIRD SCHEDULE.


THE FOURTH SCHEDULE.


THE FIFTH SCHEDULE.


THE SIXTH SCHEDULE.


THE SEVENTH SCHEDULE.


THE EIGHTH SCHEDULE.


THE NINTH SCHEDULE.


THE TENTH SCHEDULE.


THE ELEVENTH SCHEDULE.


THE TWELFTH SCHEDULE.


THE THIRTEENTH SCHEDULE.


THE FOURTEENTH SCHEDULE.


THE FIFTEENTH SCHEDULE.


CLAUSES



(9)
THE FINANCE BILL, 2016


A


BILL


to give effect to the financial proposals of the Central Government for the financial year
 2016-2017.


BE  it enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as
 follows:—


CHAPTER  I
 PRELIMINARY


1. (1)  This Act may be called the Finance Act, 2016.


(2)  Save as otherwise provided in this Act, sections 2 to 115 shall be deemed to have
 come into force on the 1st day of April, 2016.


CHAPTER II
 RATESOF INCOME-TAX


2. (1) Subject to the provisions of sub-sections (2) and (3), for the assessment year
 commencing on the 1st day of April, 2016, income-tax shall be charged at the rates specified
 in Part I of the First Schedule and such tax shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of
 the Union, calculated in each case in the manner provided therein.


Income-tax.


Short  title and
 commencement.


ASPASSEDBY LOK SABHAON 05.05.2016


Bill No. 18-C of  2016


5


10



(10)(2) In the cases to which Paragraph A of Part I of the First Schedule applies, where the
 assessee has, in the previous year, any net agricultural income exceeding five thousand rupees,
 in addition to total income, and the total income exceeds two lakh fifty thousand rupees,
 then,—


(a) the net agricultural income shall be taken into account, in the manner provided
 in clause (b) [that is to say, as if the net agricultural income were comprised in the total
 income after the first two lakh fifty thousand rupees of the total income but without
 being liable to tax], only for the purpose of charging income-tax in respect of the total
 income; and


(b) the income-tax chargeable shall be calculated as follows:—


(i) the total income and the net agricultural income shall be aggregated
 and the amount of income-tax shall be determined in respect of the aggregate
 income at the rates specified in the said Paragraph A, as if such aggregate income
 were the total income;


(ii) the net agricultural income shall be increased by a sum of two lakh
 fifty thousand rupees, and the amount of income-tax shall be determined in respect
 of the net agricultural income as so increased at the rates specified in the said
 Paragraph A, as if the net agricultural income as so increased were the total
 income;


(iii) the amount of income-tax determined in accordance with sub-clause
 (i) shall be reduced by the amount of income-tax determined in accordance with
 sub-clause (ii) and the sum so arrived at shall be the income-tax in respect of the
 total income:


Provided that in the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is of the
 age of sixty years or more but less than eighty years at any time during the previous year,
 referred to in item (II) of Paragraph A of Part I of the First Schedule, the provisions of this
 sub-section shall have effect as if for the words “two lakh fifty thousand rupees”, the words


“three lakh rupees” had been substituted:


Provided further that in the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is
 of the age of eighty years or more at any time during the previous year, referred to in item
 (III) of Paragraph A of Part I of the First Schedule, the provisions of this sub-section shall
 have effect as if for the words “two lakh fifty thousand rupees”, the words “five lakh rupees”


had been substituted.


(3) In cases to which the provisions of Chapter XII or Chapter XII-A or section 115JB or
 section 115JC or Chapter XII-FA or Chapter XII-FB or sub-section (1A) of section 161 or
 section 164 or section 164A or section 167B of the Income-tax Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred
 to as the Income-tax Act) apply, the tax chargeable shall be determined as provided in that
 Chapter or that section, and with reference to the rates imposed by sub-section (1) or the rates
 as specified in that Chapter or section, as the case may be:


Provided that the amount of income-tax computed in accordance with the provisions
 of section 111A or section 112 of the Income-tax Act shall be increased by a surcharge, for
 the purposes of the Union, as provided in Paragraph A, B, C, D or E, as the case may be, of
 Part I of the First Schedule:


Provided further that in respect of any income chargeable to tax under section 115A,
 115AB, 115AC, 115ACA, 115AD, 115B, 115BB, 115BBA, 115BBC, 115BBD, 115BBE,
 115E, 115JB or 115JC of the Income-tax Act, the amount of income-tax computed under
 this sub-section shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated,—


(a) in the case of every individual or Hindu undivided family or association of
 persons or body of individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical


43 of 1961.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45



(11)person referred to in sub-clause (vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act,
 or co-operative society or firm or local authority, at the rate of twelve per cent. of such
 income-tax, where the total income exceeds one crore rupees;


(b) in the case of every domestic company,—


(i) at the rate of seven per cent. of such income-tax, where the total income
 exceeds one crore rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;


(ii) at the rate of twelve per cent. of such income-tax, where the total
 income exceeds ten crore rupees;


(c) in the case of every company, other than a domestic company,—


(i) at the rate of two per cent. of such income-tax, where the total income
 exceeds one crore rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;


(ii) at the rate of five per cent. of such income-tax, where the total income
 exceeds ten crore rupees:


Provided also that in the case of persons mentioned in (a) above, having total income
 chargeable to tax under section 115JC of the Income-tax Act, and such income exceeds one
 crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax on such income and surcharge thereon
 shall not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax on a total income of one crore
 rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds one crore rupees:


Provided also that in the case of every company having total income chargeable to tax
 under section 115JB of the Income-tax Act, and such income exceeds one crore rupees but
 does not exceed ten crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax on such income
 and surcharge thereon, shall not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax on a total
 income of one crore rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds one crore
 rupees:


Provided also that in the case of every company having total income chargeable to tax
 under section 115JB of the Income-tax Act, and such income exceeds ten crore rupees, the
 total amount payable as income-tax on such income and surcharge thereon, shall not exceed
 the total amount payable as income-tax and surcharge on a total income of ten crore rupees
 by more than the amount of income that exceeds ten crore rupees.


(4) In cases in which tax has to be charged and paid under section 115-O or section
 115QA or sub-section (2) of section 115R or section 115TA or section 115TD of the Income-
 tax Act, the tax shall be charged and paid at the rates as specified in those sections and shall
 be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated at the rate of twelve per
 cent. of such tax.


(5) In cases in which tax has to be deducted under sections 193, 194, 194A, 194B,
 194BB, 194D, 194LBA, 194LBB, 194LBC and 195 of the Income-tax Act, at the rates in
 force, the deductions shall be made at the rates specified in Part II of the First Schedule and
 shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated in cases wherever
 prescribed, in the manner provided therein.


(6) In cases in which tax has to be deducted under sections 192A, 194C, 194DA,
 194E, 194EE, 194F, 194G, 194H, 194-I, 194-IA, 194J, 194LA, 194LB, 194LBA, 194LBB,
 194LBC, 194LC, 194LD, 196B, 196C and 196D of the Income-tax Act, the deductions
 shall be made at the rates specified in those sections and shall be increased by a surcharge,
 for purposes of the Union,—


(a) in the case of every individual or Hindu undivided family or association of
 persons or body of individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical
 person referred to in sub-clause (vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act,
 being a non-resident, calculated at the rate of fifteen per cent. of such tax, where the
 income or the aggregate of such incomes paid or likely to be paid and subject to the


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45



(12)deduction exceeds one crore rupees;


(b) in the case of every co-operative society or firm, being a non-resident,
 calculated at the rate of twelve per cent. of such tax, where the income or the aggregate
 of such incomes paid or likely to be paid and subject to the deduction exceeds one
 crore rupees;


(c) in the case of every company, other than a domestic company, calculated,—


(i) at the rate of two per cent. of such tax, where the income or the aggregate
 of such incomes paid or likely to be paid and subject to the deduction exceeds
 one crore rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;


(ii) at the rate of five per cent. of such tax, where the income or the aggregate
 of such incomes paid or likely to be paid and subject to the deduction exceeds
 ten crore rupees.


(7) In cases in which tax has to be collected under the proviso to section 194B of the
 Income-tax Act, the collection shall be made at the rates specified in Part II of the First
 Schedule, and shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated, in
 cases wherever prescribed, in the manner provided therein.


(8) In cases in which tax has to be collected under section 206C of the Income-tax Act,
 the collection shall be made at the rates specified in that section and shall be increased by a
 surcharge, for purposes of the Union,—


(a) in the case of every individual or Hindu undivided family or association of
 persons or body of individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical
 person referred to in sub-clause (vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act,
 being a non-resident, calculated at the rate of fifteen per cent. of such tax, where the
 amount or the aggregate of such amounts collected and subject to the collection exceeds
 one crore rupees;


(b) in the case of every co-operative society or firm, being a non-resident,
 calculated at the rate of twelve per cent. of such tax, where the amount or the aggregate
 of such amounts collected and subject to the collection exceeds one crore rupees;


(c) in the case of every company, other than a domestic company, calculated,—


(i) at the rate of two per cent. of such tax, where the amount or the aggregate
 of such amounts collected and subject to the collection exceeds one crore rupees
 but does not exceed ten crore rupees;


(ii) at the rate of five per cent. of such tax, where the amount or the aggregate
 of such amounts collected and subject to the collection exceeds ten crore rupees.


(9) Subject to the provisions of sub-section (10), in cases in which income-tax has to
 be charged under sub-section (4) of section 172 or sub-section (2) of section 174 or section
 174A or section 175 or sub-section (2) of section 176 of the Income-tax Act or deducted
 from, or paid on, income chargeable under the head “Salaries” under section 192 of the said
 Act or in which the “advance tax” payable under Chapter XVII-C of the said Act has to be
 computed at the rate or rates in force, such income-tax or, as the case may be, “advance tax”


shall be charged, deducted or computed at the rate or rates specified in Part III of the First
 Schedule and such tax shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated
 in such cases and in such manner as provided therein:


Provided that in cases to which the provisions of Chapter XII or Chapter XII-A or
 section 115JB or section 115JC or Chapter XII-FA or Chapter XII-FB or sub-section (1A) of
 section 161 or section 164 or section 164A or section 167B of the Income-tax Act apply,


“advance tax” shall be computed with reference to the rates imposed by this sub-section or
 the rates as specified in that Chapter or section, as the case may be:


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45



(13)Provided further that the amount of “advance tax” computed in accordance with the
 provisions of section 111A or section 112 of the Income-tax Act shall be increased by a
 surcharge, for purposes of the Union, as provided in Paragraph A, B, C, D or E, as the case
 may be, of Part III of the First Schedule:


Provided also that in respect of any income chargeable to tax under section 115A,
 115AB, 115AC, 115ACA, 115AD, 115B, 115BA, 115BB, 115BBA, 115BBC, 115BBD,
 115BBDA, 115BBE, 115BBF, 115E, 115JB or 115JC of the Income-tax Act, “advance tax”


computed under the first proviso shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the
 Union, calculated,—


(a) in the case of every individual or Hindu undivided family or association of
 persons or body of individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical
 person referred to in sub-clause (vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act,
 calculated at the rate of fifteen per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total income
 exceeds one crore rupees;


(b) in the case of every co-operative society or firm or local authority, calculated
 at the rate of twelve per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total income exceeds
 one crore rupees;


(c) in the case of every domestic company, calculated,—


(i) at the rate of seven per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total
 income exceeds one crore rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;


(ii) at the rate of twelve per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total
 income exceeds ten crore rupees;


(d) in the case of every company, other than a domestic company, calculated,—


(i) at the rate of two per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total income
 exceeds one crore rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;


(ii) at the rate of five per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total
 income exceeds ten crore rupees:


Provided also that in the case of persons mentioned in (a) and (b) above, having total
 income chargeable to tax under section 115JC of the Income-tax Act, and such income
 exceeds one crore rupees, the total amount payable as “advance tax” on such income and
 surcharge thereon shall not exceed the total amount payable as “advance tax” on a total
 income of one crore rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds one crore
 rupees:


Provided also that in the case of every company having total income chargeable to tax
 under section 115JB of the Income-tax Act, and such income exceeds one crore rupees but
 does not exceed ten crore rupees, the total amount payable as “advance tax” on such income
 and surcharge thereon, shall not exceed the total amount payable as “advance tax” on a total
 income of one crore rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds one crore
 rupees:


Provided also that in the case of every company having total income chargeable to tax
 under section 115JB of the Income-tax Act, and such income exceeds ten crore rupees, the
 total amount payable as “advance tax” on such income and surcharge thereon, shall not
 exceed the total amount payable as “advance tax” and surcharge on a total income of ten
 crore rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds ten crore rupees.


(10) In cases to which Paragraph A of Part III of the First Schedule applies, where the
 assessee has, in the previous year or, if by virtue of any provision of the Income-tax Act,
 income-tax is to be charged in respect of the income of a period other than the previous year,
 in such other period, any net agricultural income exceeding five thousand rupees, in addition
 to total income and the total income exceeds two lakh fifty thousand rupees, then, in charging


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45



(14)income-tax under sub-section (2) of section 174 or section 174A or section 175 or sub-
 section (2) of section 176 of the said Act or in computing the “advance tax” payable under
 Chapter XVII-C of the said Act, at the rate or rates in force,—


(a) the net agricultural income shall be taken into account, in the manner provided
 in clause (b) [that is to say, as if the net agricultural income were comprised in the total
 income after the first two lakh fifty thousand rupees of the total income but without
 being liable to tax], only for the purpose of charging or computing such income-tax or,
 as the case may be, “advance tax” in respect of the total income; and


(b) such income-tax or, as the case may be, “advance tax” shall be so charged or
 computed as follows:—


(i) the total income and the net agricultural income shall be aggregated
 and the amount of income-tax or “advance tax” shall be determined in respect of
 the aggregate income at the rates specified in the said Paragraph A, as if such
 aggregate income were the total income;


(ii) the net agricultural income shall be increased by a sum of two lakh
 fifty thousand rupees, and the amount of income-tax or “advance tax” shall be
 determined in respect of the net agricultural income as so increased at the rates
 specified in the said Paragraph A, as if the net agricultural income were the total
 income;


(iii) the amount of income-tax or “advance tax” determined in accordance
 with sub-clause (i) shall be reduced by the amount of income-tax or, as the case
 may be, “advance tax” determined in accordance with sub-clause (ii) and the
 sum so arrived at shall be the income-tax or, as the case may be, “advance tax”


in respect of the total income:


Provided that in the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is of the
 age of sixty years or more but less than eighty years at any time during the previous year,
 referred to in item (II) of Paragraph A of Part III of the First Schedule, the provisions of this
 sub-section shall have effect as if for the words “two lakh fifty thousand rupees”, the words


“three lakh rupees” had been substituted:


Provided further that in the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is
 of the age of eighty years or more at any time during the previous year, referred to in item
 (III) of Paragraph A of Part III of the First Schedule, the provisions of this sub-section shall
 have effect as if for the words “two lakh fifty thousand rupees”, the words “five lakh rupees”


had been substituted:


Provided also that the amount of income-tax or “advance tax” so arrived at, shall be
 increased by a surcharge for purposes of the Union calculated in each case, in the manner
 provided therein.


(11) The amount of income-tax as specified in sub-sections (1) to (10) and as increased
 by the applicable surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated in the manner provided
 therein, shall be further increased by an additional surcharge, for purposes of the Union, to
 be called the “Education Cess on income-tax”, calculated at the rate of two per cent. of such
 income-tax and surcharge so as to fulfil the commitment of the Government to provide and
 finance universalised quality basic education:


Provided that nothing contained in this sub-section shall apply to cases in which tax is
 to be deducted or collected under the sections of the Income-tax Act mentioned in sub-
 sections (5), (6), (7) and (8), if the income subjected to deduction of tax at source or collection
 of tax at source is paid to a domestic company and any other person who is resident in India.


(12) The amount of income-tax as specified in sub-sections (1) to (10) and as increased
 by the applicable surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated in the manner provided
 therein, shall also be increased by an additional surcharge, for purposes of the Union, to be


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45


50



(15)called the “Secondary and Higher Education Cess on income-tax”, calculated at the rate of
 one per cent. of such income-tax and surcharge so as to fulfil the commitment of the
 Government to provide and finance secondary and higher education:


Provided that nothing contained in this sub-section shall apply to cases in which tax is
 to be deducted or collected under the sections of the Income-tax Act mentioned in sub-
 sections (5), (6), (7) and (8), if the income subjected to deduction of tax at source or collection
 of tax at source is paid to a domestic company and any other person who is resident in India.


(13) For the purposes of  this section and the First Schedule,—


(a) “domestic company” means an Indian company or any other company which,
 in respect of its income liable to income-tax under the Income-tax Act, for the assessment
 year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2016, has made the prescribed arrangements
 for the declaration and payment within India of the dividends (including dividends on
 preference shares) payable out of such income;


(b) “insurance commission” means any remuneration or reward, whether by way
 of commission or otherwise, for soliciting or procuring insurance business (including
 business relating to the continuance, renewal or revival of policies of insurance);


(c) “net agricultural income”, in relation to a person, means the total amount of
 agricultural income, from whatever source derived, of that person computed in
 accordance with the rules contained in Part IV of the First Schedule;


(d) all other words and expressions used in this section and the First Schedule
 but not defined in this sub-section and defined in the Income-tax Act shall have the
 meanings, respectively, assigned to them in that Act.


CHAPTER III
 DIRECT TAXES


Income-tax
 3. In section 2 of the Income-tax Act,—


(a) in clause (14), in item (vi), after the words and figures “Gold Deposit Scheme,
 1999”, the words and figures “or deposit certificates issued under the Gold Monetisation
 Scheme, 2015” shall be inserted;


(b) after clause (23B), the following clause shall be inserted with effect from the
 1st day of June, 2016, namely:—


‘(23C) “hearing” includes communication of data and documents through
 electronic mode;’;


(c) in clause (24), in sub-clause (xviii), for the words, figures and brackets “other
 than the subsidy or grant or reimbursement which is taken into account for determination
 of the actual cost of the asset in accordance with the provisions of Explanation 10 to
 clause (1) of section 43”, the following shall be substituted with effect from the 1st
 day of April, 2017, namely:—


“other than,—


(a) the subsidy or grant or reimbursement which is taken into account
 for determination of the actual cost of the asset in accordance with the
 provisions of Explanation 10 to clause (1) of section 43; or


(b) the subsidy or grant by the Central Government for the purpose of
 the corpus of a trust or institution established by the Central Government or
 a State Government, as the case may be;”;


Amendment
 of section 2.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45



(16)(d) in clause (37A), in sub-clause (iii), after the words, figures and letters “section
 194LBA or”, the words, figures and letters “section 194LBB or section 194LBC or”


shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of June, 2016;


(e) in clause (42A), after the second proviso and before Explanation 1, the
 following proviso shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


‘Provided also that in the case of a share of a company (not being a share
 listed in a recognised stock exchange in India), the provisions of this clause
 shall have effect as if for the words “thrity-six months”, the words “twenty-four
 months” had been substituted.’.


4. In section 6 of the Income-tax Act, for clause (3), the following clause shall be
 substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


‘(3) A company is said to be a resident in India in any previous year, if—


(i) it is an Indian company; or


(ii) its place of effective management, in that year, is in India.


Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause “place of effective management”


means a place where key management and commercial decisions that are necessary
 for the conduct of business of an entity as a whole are, in substance made.’.


5. In section 9 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (i), in Explanation 1,
 after clause (d), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—


“(e) in the case of a foreign company engaged in the business of mining of
 diamonds, no income shall be deemed to accrue or arise in India to it through or from
 the activities which are confined to the display of uncut and unassorted diamond in
 any special zone notified by the Central Government in the Official Gazette in this
 behalf.”.


6. In section 9A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (3), with effect from the 1st day
 of April, 2017,—


(i) in clause (b), after the words “has been entered into”, the words “or is
 established or incorporated or registered in a country or a specified territory notified
 by the Central Government in this behalf” shall be inserted;


(ii) in clause (k), the words “or from India” shall be omitted.


7. In section 10 of the Income-tax Act,—


(A) with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017,—


(i) after clause (12), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—


“(12A) any payment from the National Pension System Trust to an
 employee on closure of his account or on his opting out of the pension
 scheme referred to in section 80CCD, to the extent it does not exceed
 forty per cent. of the total amount payable to him at the time of such closure
 or his opting out of the scheme;”;


(ii) in clause (13),—


(I) in sub-clause (iv), for the word “thereon”, the words “thereon;


or” shall be substituted;


Amendment of
 section 6.


Amendment of
 section 9.


Amendment of
 section 9A.


Amendment of
 section 10.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40



(17)(II) after sub-clause (iv), the following sub-clause shall be inserted,
 namely:—


“(v) by way of transfer to the account of the employee under
 a pension scheme referred to in section 80CCD and notified by the
 Central Government;”;


(B) in clause (15), in sub-clause (vi), after the words and figures “Gold Deposit
 Scheme, 1999”, the words and figures “or deposit certificates issued under the Gold
 Monetisation Scheme, 2015” shall be inserted;


(C) with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017,—


(I) in clause (23DA), in the Explanation,—


(1) in clause (a), after sub-clause (i), the following sub-clause shall
 be inserted, namely:—


“(ia) in clause (z) of sub-section (1) of section 2 of the
 Securitisation and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and
 Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002; or”;


(2) in clause (b), for the word, figures and letters “section 115TC”,
 the word, figures and letters “section 115TCA” shall be substituted;


(II) in clause (23FC), for the words “by way of interest received or
 receivable from a special purpose vehicle”, the following shall be substituted,
 namely:—


“by way of—


(a) interest received or receivable from a special purpose
 vehicle; or


(b) dividend referred to in sub-section (7) of section 115-O”;


(III) in clause (23FD), for the words, brackets, figures and letters “in clause
 (23FC)”, the words, brackets, letters and figures “in sub-clause (a) of clause
 (23FC)” shall be substituted;


(IV) in clause (34), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—


“Provided that nothing in this clause shall apply to any income by
 way of dividend chargeable to tax in accordance with the provisions of
 section 115BBDA;”;


(V) in clause (35A),—


(a) before the Explanation, the following proviso shall be inserted,
 namely:—


“Provided that nothing contained in this clause shall apply to
 any income by way of distributed income referred to in the said
 section, received on or after the 1st day of June, 2016.”;


(b) in the Explanation, for the word, figures and letters “section
 115TC”, the word, figures and letters “section 115TCA” shall be
 substituted;


(VI) in clause (38),—


(i) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
 namely:—


“Provided also that nothing contained in sub-clause (b) shall


54 of 2002.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40



(18)apply to a transaction undertaken on a recognised stock exchange
 located in any International Financial Services Centre and where
 the consideration for such transaction is paid or payable in foreign
 currency.”;


(ii) for the Explanation, the following Explanation shall be
 substituted, namely:—


‘Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause,—


(a) “equity oriented fund” means a fund—


(i) where the investible funds are invested by way of
 equity shares in domestic companies to the extent of more
 than sixty-five per cent. of the total proceeds of such fund;


and


(ii) which has been set up under a scheme of a Mutual
 Fund specified under clause (23D):


Provided that the percentage of equity share holding of
 the fund shall be computed with reference to the annual average
 of the monthly averages of the opening and closing figures;


(b) “International Financial Services Centre” shall have the
 same meaning as assigned to it in clause (q) of section 2 of the
 Special Economic Zones Act, 2005;


(c) “recognised stock exchange” shall have the meaning
 assigned to it in clause (ii) of the Explanation 1 to sub-section (5) of
 section 43.’;


(D) after clause (48), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—


“(48A) any income accruing or arising to a foreign company on
 account of storage of crude oil in a facility in India and sale of crude oil
 therefrom to any person resident in India:


Provided that —


(i) the storage and sale by the foreign company is pursuant to
 an agreement or an arrangement entered into by the Central
 Government or approved by the Central Government; and


(ii) having regard to the national interest, the foreign company
 and the agreement or arrangement are notified by the Central
 Government in this behalf;”;


(E) after clause (49), the following clause shall be inserted with effect
 from the 1st day of June, 2016, namely:—


‘(50) any income arising from any specified service provided on or
 after the date on which the provisions of Chapter VIII of the Finance Act,
 2016 comes into force and chargeable to equalisation levy under that
 Chapter.


Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause, “specified service”


shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (i) of section 161 of Chapter
 VIII of the Finance Act, 2016.’.


8. In section 10AA of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), for the words and figures


“April, 2006, a deduction of”, the words, figures and letters “April, 2006, but before the 1st
 day of April, 2021, the following deduction shall be allowed” shall be substituted with effect
 from the 1st day of April, 2017.


Amendment of
 section 10AA.


28 of 2005.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45



(19)9. In section 17 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), in clause (vii), for the words


“one lakh rupees”, the words “one lakh and fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted with
 effect from the 1st day of April, 2017.


10. In section 24 of the Income-tax Act, in clause (b), in the second proviso, for the
 words “three years”, the words “five years” shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day
 of April, 2017.


11. For sections 25A, 25AA and 25B of the Income-tax Act, the following section
 shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


‘25A. (1) The amount of arrears of rent received from a tenant or the unrealised
 rent realised subsequently from a tenant, as the case may be, by an assessee shall be
 deemed to be the income from house property in respect of the financial year in which
 such rent is received or realised, and shall be included in the total income of the
 assessee under the head “Income from house property”, whether the assessee is the
 owner of the property or not in that financial year.


(2) A sum equal to thirty per cent. of the arrears of rent or the unrealised rent
 referred to in sub-section (1) shall be allowed as deduction.’.


12. In section 28 of the Income-tax Act, in clause (va), with effect from the 1st day of
 April, 2017,—


(A) in sub-clause (a), after the words “any business”, the words “or profession”


shall be inserted;


(B) in the proviso, in clause (i), after the words “any business”, the words “or
 profession” shall be inserted.


13. In section 32 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (iia), for the
 words “or in the business of generation or generation and distribution”, the words “or in the
 business of generation, transmission or distribution” shall be substituted with effect from the
 1st day of April, 2017.


14. In section 32AC of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1A),—


(i) for the words “acquired and installed during any previous year exceeds
 twenty-five crore rupees”, the words, figures and letters “acquired during any previous
 year exceeds twenty-five crore rupees and such assets are installed on or before the
 31st day of March, 2017” shall be substituted;


(ii) before the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—


“Provided that where the installation of the new assets are in a year other
 than the year of acquisition, the deduction under this sub-section shall be allowed
 in the year in which the new assets are installed.”;


(iii) in the existing proviso, for the words “Provided that”, the words “Provided
 further that” shall be substituted.


15. In section 35 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2018,—


(i) in sub-section (1),—


(a) in clause (ii),—


(I) for the words “one and three-fourth”, the words “one and one-
 half” shall be substituted;


(II) after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
 namely:—


“Provided further that where any sum is paid to such
 association, university, college or other institution in a previous year
 relevant to the assessment year beginning on or after the 1st day of
 April, 2021, the deduction under this clause shall be equal to the
 sum so paid;”;


Amendment of
 section 28.


Amendment of
 section 32.


Amendment of
 section 32AC.


Amendment of
 section 35.


Amendment of
 section 17.


Amendment of
 section 24.


Substitution of
 new section for
 sections 25A,
 25AA and 25B.


Special
 provision for
 arrears of rent
 and unrealised
 rent received
 subsequently.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45



(20)(b) in clause (iia), the words “an amount equal to one and one-fourth times
 of” shall be omitted;


(c) in clause (iii), the words “an amount equal to one and one-fourth times
 of” shall be omitted;


(ii) in sub-section (2AA),—


(A) in clause (a), for the words “two times”, the words “one and one-half
 times” shall be substituted;


(B) after the proviso and before Explanation 1, the following proviso
 shall be inserted, namely:—


“Provided further that where any sum is paid to such National
 Laboratory or university or Indian Institute of Technology or specified
 person in a previous year relevant to the assessment year beginning on or
 after the 1st day of April, 2021, the deduction under this sub-section shall
 be equal to the sum so paid.”;


(iii) in sub-section (2AB),—


(a) in clause (1), for the words “two times”, the words “one and one-half
 times” shall be substituted;


(b) after clause (1) and before the Explanation, the following proviso shall
 be inserted, namely:—


“Provided that where such expenditure on scientific research (not being
 expenditure in the nature of cost of any land or building) on in-house research
 and development facility is incurred in a previous year relevant to the
 assessment year beginning on or after the 1st day of April, 2021, the deduction
 under this clause shall be equal to the expenditure so incurred.”;


(c) clause (5) shall be omitted.


16. After section 35AB of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted
 with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


‘35ABA. (1) In respect of any expenditure, being in the nature of capital
 expenditure, incurred for acquiring any right to use spectrum for telecommunication
 services either before the commencement of the business or thereafter at any time
 during any previous year and for which payment has actually been made to obtain a
 right to use spectrum, there shall, subject to and in accordance with the provisions of
 this section, be allowed for each of the relevant previous years, a deduction equal to
 the appropriate fraction of the amount of such expenditure.


(2) The provisions contained in sub-sections (2) to (8) of section 35ABB, shall
 apply as if for the word “licence”, the word “spectrum” had been substituted.


(3) Where, in a previous year, any deduction has been claimed and granted to
 the assessee under sub-section  (1), and, subsequently, there is failure to comply with
 any of the provisions of this section, then,—


(a) the deduction shall be deemed to have been worngly allowed;


(b) the Assessing Officer may, notwithstanding anything contained in this
 Act, re-compute the total income of the assessee for the said previous year and
 make the necessary rectification;


(c)  the provisions of section 154 shall, so far as may be, apply and the
 period of four years specified in sub-section (7) of that section being reckoned
 from the end of the previous year in which the failure to comply with the
 provisions of this section takes place.


Explanation.— For the purposes of this section,—


(i) “relevant previous years” means,—


(A) in a case where the spectrum fee is actually paid before the
 commencement of the business to operate telecommunication services,
 the previous years beginning with the previous year in which such business
 commenced;


(B) in any other case, the previous years beginning with the previous
 year in which the spectrum fee is actually paid,


Insertion of new
 section 35ABA.


Expenditure for
 obtaining right
 to use spectrum
 for


telecommuni-
 cation  services.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45


50


55



(21)and the subsequent previous year or years during which the spectrum, for which the
 fee is paid, shall be in force;


(ii) “appropriate fraction” means the fraction, the numerator of which is
 one and the denominator of which is the total number of the relevant previous
 years;


(iii) “payment has actually been made” means the actual payment of
 expenditure irrespective of the previous year in which the liability for the
 expenditure was incurred according to the method of accounting regularly
 employed by the assessee or payable in such manner as may be prescribed.’.


17. In section 35AC of the Income-tax Act, after sub-section (6) and before the
 Explanation, the following sub-section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of
 April, 2017, namely:—


“(7) No deduction under this section shall be allowed in respect of any assessment
 year commencing on or after the 1st day of April, 2018.”.


18. In section 35AD of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April,
 2018,—


(a) sub-section (1A) shall be omitted;


(b) in sub-section (2), after clause (iii), the following clause shall be inserted,
 namely:—


“(iv) where the business is of the nature referred to in sub-clause (xiv) of
 clause (c) of sub-section (8), such business,—


(A) is owned by a company registered in India or by a consortium of
 such companies or by an authority or a board or corporation or any other
 body established or constituted under any Central or State Act;


(B) entity referred to in sub-clause (A) has entered into an agreement
 with the Central Government or a State Government or a local authority
 or any other statutory body for developing or operating and maintaining
 or developing, operating and maintaining, a new infrastructure facility.”;


(c) in sub-section (5),—


(I) in clause (aj), the word “and” occurring at the end shall be omitted;


(II) after clause (aj), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—


“(ak) on or after the 1st day of April, 2017, where the specified
 business is in the nature of developing or operating and maintaining or
 developing, operating and maintaining, any infrastructure facility; and”;


(d) in sub-section (8),—


(I) after clause (b), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—


‘(ba) “infrastructure facility” means—


(i) a road including toll road, a bridge or a rail system;


(ii) a highway project including housing or other activities
 being an integral part of the highway project;


(iii) a water supply project, water treatment system, irrigation
 project, sanitation and sewerage system or solid waste management
 system;


(iv) a port, airport, inland waterway, inland port or navigational
 channel in the sea;’;


(II) in clause (c), after sub-clause (xiii), the following sub-clause shall be
 inserted, namely:—


“(xiv) developing or maintaining and operating or developing,
 maintaining and operating a new infrastructure facility.”.


Amendment of
 section 35AC.


Amendment of
 section 35AD.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45



(22)19. In section 35CCC of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), the following proviso
 shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


‘Provided that for the assessment year beginning on or after the 1st day of
 April, 2021, the provisions of this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words ‘‘a
 sum equal to one and one-half times of’’, the words ‘‘a sum equal to’’ had been
 substituted.’.


20. In section 35CCD of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), the following proviso
 shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


‘Provided that for the assessment year beginning on or after the 1st day of April,
 2021, the provisions of this sub-section shall have effect, as if for the words “an amount
 equal to one and one-half times of”, the words “a sum equal to” had been substituted.’.


21. In section 36 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (viia), with effect
 from the 1st day of April, 2017,—


(i) after sub-clause (c) and before the Explanation, the following sub-clause shall be
 inserted, namely:—


“(d) a non-banking financial company, an amount not exceeding five per
 cent. of the total income (computed before making any deduction under this
 clause and Chapter VI-A).”;


(ii) in the Explanation, after clause (vi), the following clause shall be inserted,
 namely:—


‘(vii) “non-banking financial company” shall have the meaning assigned
 to it in clause (f) of section 45-I of the Reserve Bank of India Act, 1934;’.


22. In section 40 of the Income-tax Act, in clause (a), after sub-clause (ia), the following
 sub-clause shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of June, 2016, namely:—


“(ib)  any consideration paid or payable to a non-resident for a specified service
 on which equalisation levy is deductible under the provisions of Chapter VIII of the
 Finance Act, 2016, and such levy has not been deducted or after deduction, has not
 been paid on or before the due date specified in sub-section (1) of section 139:


Provided that where in respect of any such consideration, the equalisation levy
 has been deducted in any subsequent year or has been deducted during the previous
 year but paid after the due date specified in sub-section (1) of section 139, such sum
 shall be allowed as a deduction in computing the income of the previous year in which
 such levy has been paid;”.


   23. In section 43B of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April,
 2017,—


(i) in clause (f), for the word “employee” occurring at the end, the words


“employee, or” shall be substituted;


(ii) after clause (f), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—


“(g) any sum payable by the assessee to the Indian Railways for the use of
 railway assets,”.


24. In section 44AA of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), for clause (iv), the
 following clause shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


“(iv) where the provisions of sub-section (4) of section 44AD are applicable
 in his case and his income exceeds the maximum amount which is not chargeable to
 income-tax in any previous year,”.


25. In section 44AB of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April,
 2017,—


(i) in clause (b), for the words “twenty-five lakh rupees”, the words “fifty lakh
 rupees” shall be substituted;


(ii) in clause (d),—


(a) for the word “business” wherever it occurs, the word “profession”


shall be substituted;


Amendment of
 section
 35CCC.


Amendment of
 section
 35CCD.


Amendment of
 section 36.


Amendment of
 section 40.


Amendment of
 section 43B.


Amendment of
 section 44AA.


Amendment of
 section 44AB.


2 of 1934.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45


50



(23)(b) for the words, figures and letters “under section 44AD”, the words,
 figures and letters “under section 44ADA” shall be substituted;


(c) for the words “previous year”, the words “previous year; or” shall be
 substituted;


(iii) after clause (d) and before the long line, the following clause shall be inserted,
 namely:—


“(e) carrying on the business shall, if the provisions of sub-section (4) of
 section 44AD are applicable in his case and his income exceeds the maximum
 amount which is not chargeable to income-tax in any previous year,”.


26. In section 44AD of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April,
 2017,—


(a) in sub-section (2), the proviso shall be omitted;


(b) for sub-sections (4) and (5), the following sub-sections shall be substituted,
 namely:—


“(4) Where an eligible assessee declares profit for any previous year
 in accordance with the provisions of this section and he declares profit for
 any of the five assessment years relevant to the previous year succeeding
 such previous year not in accordance with the provisions of sub-section (1),
 he shall not be eligible to claim the benefit of the provisions of this section
 for five assessment years subsequent to the assessment year relevant to the
 previous year in which the profit has not been declared in accordance with
 the provisions of sub-section (1).


(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this
 section, an eligible assessee to whom the provisions of sub-section (4) are applicable
 and whose total income exceeds the maximum amount which is not chargeable to
 income-tax , shall be required to keep and maintain such books of account and
 other documents as required under sub-section (2) of section 44AA and get them
 audited and furnish a report of such audit as required under section 44AB.”;


(c) in the Explanation, in clause (b), in sub-clause (ii), for the words “one crore
 rupees” occurring at the end, the words “two crore rupees” shall be substituted.


27. After section 44AD of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted
 with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


‘44ADA.(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in sections 28 to 43C, in the
 case of an assessee, being a resident in India, who is engaged in a profession referred
 to in sub-section (1) of section 44AA and whose total gross receipts do not exceed
 fifty lakh rupees in a previous year, a sum equal to fifty per cent. of the total gross
 receipts of the assessee in the previous year on account of such profession or, as the
 case may be, a sum higher than the aforesaid sum claimed to have been earned by the
 assessee, shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of such profession chargeable to
 tax under the head “Profits and gains of business or profession”.


(2) Any deduction allowable under the provisions of sections 30 to 38 shall, for
 the purposes of sub-section (1), be deemed to have been already given full effect to
 and no further deduction under those sections shall be allowed.


(3) The written down value of any asset used for the purposes of profession
 shall be deemed to have been calculated as if the assessee had claimed and had been
 actually allowed the deduction in respect of the depreciation for each of the relevant
 assessment years.


(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this section,
 an assessee who claims that his profits and gains from the profession are lower than
 the profits and gains specified in sub-section (1) and whose total income exceeds the


Amendment of
 section 44AD.


Insertion of
 new section
 44ADA.


Special
 provision for
 computing
 profits and
 gains of
 profession on
 presumptive
 basis.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45



(24)maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax, shall be required to keep
 and maintain such books of account and other documents as required under sub-section
 (1) of section 44AA and get them audited and furnish a report of such audit as required
 under section 44AB.’.


28. In section 47 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017,—


(A) after clause (viib), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—


“(viic) any transfer of Sovereign Gold Bond issued by the Reserve Bank
 of India under the Sovereign Gold Bond Scheme, 2015, by way of redemption,
 by an assessee being an individual;”;


(B) in clause (xiiib), in the proviso,—


(I) in clause (e), the word “and” appearing at the end shall be omitted;


(II) after clause (e), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—


“(ea) the total value of the assets as appearing in the books of account
 of the company in any of the three previous years preceding the previous
 year in which the conversion takes place does not exceed five crore rupees;


and;”;


(C) after clause (xviii), the following clause shall be inserted with effect from
 the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


‘(xix) any transfer by a unit holder of a capital asset, being a unit or
 units, held by him in the consolidating plan of a mutual fund scheme, made
 in consideration of the allotment to him of a capital asset, being a unit or
 units, in the consolidated plan of that scheme of the mutual fund.


Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause,—


(a) “consolidating plan” means the plan within a scheme of a mutual
 fund which merges under the process of consolidation of the plans within
 a scheme of mutual fund in accordance with the Securities and Exchange
 Board of India (Mutual Funds) Regulations, 1996 made under the Securities
 and Exchange Board of India Act, 1992;


(b) “consolidated plan” means the plan with which the consolidating
 plan merges or which is formed as a result of such merger;


(c) “mutual fund” means a mutual fund specified under clause (23D)
 of section 10.’.


29. In section 48 of the Income-tax Act, for the third proviso, the following provisos
 shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


“Provided also that nothing contained in the second proviso shall apply to the
 long-term capital gain arising from the transfer of a long-term capital asset, being a
 bond or debenture other than—


(a) capital indexed bonds issued by the Government; or


(b) Sovereign Gold Bond issued by the Reserve Bank of India under the
 Sovereign Gold Bond Scheme, 2015:


Provided also that in case of an assessee being a non-resident, any gains arising
 on account of appreciation of rupee against a foreign currency at the time of redemption
 of rupee denominated bond of an Indian company subscribed by him, shall be ignored
 for the purposes of computation of full value of consideration under this section:”.


30. In section 49 of the Income-tax Act, after sub-section (4) the following sub-section
 shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2017, namely:—


‘‘(5) Where the capital gain arises from the transfer of an asset declared under
 the Income Declaration Scheme, 2016, and the tax, surcharge and penalty have been
 paid in accordance with the provisions of the Scheme on the fair market value of the
 asset as on the date of commencement of the Scheme, the cost of acquisition of the


Amendment of
 section 47.


Amendment of
 section 48.


Amendment of
 section 49.


15 of 1992.


5


10


15


20


25


30


35


40


45


50




    
  




      
      
        
      


            
    
        References

        
            	
                        
                    



            
                View            
        

    


      
        
          

                    Download now ( PDF - 208 Page - 840.70 KB )
            

      


      
      
        
  Related documents

  
    
      
          
        
            The facts of the present case are as follows
        
      

        (2)   Notwithstanding   anything   contained   in sub-section   (1),   in   case   of   land   acquisition proceedings   initiated   under   the   Land   Acquisition Act, 1894 (1

    
      
          
        
            An Act to provide for the better administration of Wakfs and for matters connected therewith or incidental thereto.
        
      

        Clause 23.— This clause seeks to amend section 37 of the Act relating to register of wakfs by re-numbering the  said section 37 as sub-section (1) thereof and to insert new

    
      
          
        
            THE COMPANIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2020
        
      

        (3) If a company fails to file the copy of the financial statements under sub-section (1) or sub-section (2), as the case may be, before the expiry of the period specified therein

    
      
          
        
            Under the Income Tax Act, 1961 
        
      

        (2)  The officer authorised to make a requisition under sub-section (1) of  section 132A (hereinafter referred to as the requisitioning officer) shall  make the requisition in

    
      
          
        
            Nil Nil 2 Chapter 99 Services by way of transfer of a going concern, as a whole or an independent part thereof
        
      

        Provided  further  that  in  case  where  continuous  supply  of  service,  as  defined in sub-section (33) of section 2 of  the Central Goods and Services Tax Act,  2017,  is 

    
      
          
        
            DIRECT TAX LAWS 
        
      

        (c)  where any duty as determined under sub-section (10) of section 11A and the interest payable  thereon under section 11AA in respect of transactions referred to in clause (b) is

    
      
          
        
            Tax Collection Mechanism: Assessee requires to pay tax on his income by way of:
        
      

         Notwithstanding anything contained in section 194 or section no deduction of tax shall be made in TDS in the case of an individual, who is resident in India, if his estimated

    
      
          
        
            LIST OF SERVICES AT NIL RATE
        
      

        Provided further that in case where continuous supply of service, as defined in sub-section (33) of  section 2 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017, is provided by

      



      

    

    
            
            
      
  Related documents

  
          
        
    
        
    
    
        
            THE WILD LIFE (PROTECTION) AMENDMENT BILL, 2021
        
        
            
                
                    
                    159
                

                
                    
                    0
                

                
                    
                    0
                

            

        

    


      

          
        
    
        
    
    
        
            THE MAINTENANCE AND WELFARE OF PARENTS AND SENIOR CITIZENS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2019
        
        
            
                
                    
                    21
                

                
                    
                    0
                

                
                    
                    0
                

            

        

    


      

          
        
    
        
    
    
        
            The Root of the Matter
        
        
            
                
                    
                    37
                

                
                    
                    0
                

                
                    
                    0
                

            

        

    


      

          
        
    
        
    
    
        
            HIGH COURT OF MADHYA PRADESH : JABALPUR  WRIT PETITION No. 4617/2015 
        
        
            
                
                    
                    33
                

                
                    
                    0
                

                
                    
                    0
                

            

        

    


      

          
        
    
        
    
    
        
            CORPORATE TAX PLANNING 
        
        
            
                
                    
                    45
                

                
                    
                    0
                

                
                    
                    0
                

            

        

    


      

          
        
    
        
    
    
        
            The Insecticides Act, 1968  (Act No.46 of 1968) 
        
        
            
                
                    
                    40
                

                
                    
                    0
                

                
                    
                    0
                

            

        

    


      

          
        
    
        
    
    
        
            (c) “Depository” shall mean a depository as defined under clause (e) of sub section (1) of section 2 of the Depositories Act, 1996
        
        
            
                
                    
                    37
                

                
                    
                    0
                

                
                    
                    0
                

            

        

    


      

          
        
    
        
    
    
        
            of  the  Major 
        
        
            
                
                    
                    99
                

                
                    
                    0
                

                
                    
                    0
                

            

        

    


      

      


              
          
            
          

        

          

  




  
  
  
    
      
        Company

        	
             About us
          
	
            Sitemap

          


      

      
        Contact  &  Help

        	
             Contact us
          
	
             Feedback
          


      

      
        Legal

        	
             Terms of use
          
	
             Policy
          


      

      
        Social

        	
            
              
                
              
              Linkedin
            

          
	
            
              
                
              
              Facebook
            

          
	
            
              
                
              
              Twitter
            

          
	
            
              
                
              
              Pinterest
            

          


      

      
        Get our free apps

        	
              
                
              
            


      

    

    
      
        
          Schools
          
            
          
          Topics
                  

        
          
                        Language:
            
              English
              
                
              
            
          

          Copyright azpdf.net © 2024

        

      

    

  




    



  
        
        
        
          


        
    
  
  
  




    
    

    
        
            
                

            

            
                                
            

        

    




    
        
            
                
                    
                        
                            
  

                            

                        
                            
  

                            

                        
                            
  

                            

                        
                            
  

                            

                        
                            
  

                            

                    

                    
                        

                        

                        

                        
                            
                                
                                
                                    
                                

                            

                        
                    

                    
                        
                            
                                
  

                                
                        

                        
                            
                                
  

                                
                        

                    

                

                                    
                        
                    

                            

        

    


